From: jeffrey E. [jeevacation@gmail.com]

Sent: 5/5/2018 10:07:11 AM
To: NEVERERGY |
Subject: Re: Trump Is Said to Know of Stormy Daniels Payment Months Before He Denied It - The New York Times

Once you know the code it’s all clear

On Sat, May 5, 2018 at 1:46 AM jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:
Good catch and yes

On Fri, May 4, 2018 at 10:09 PM Steve Bannon G ot

https://mobile.nytimes.com/2018/05/04/us/politics/trump-hush-payment-stormy-
daniels.html?action=click&module=Top%20Stories&pgtype=Homepage
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