From: jeffrey E. [jeevacation@gmail.com]

Sent: 1/15/2017 2:28:57 PM
To: Alireza Ittihadieh [ R
Subject: Re:

new , friend asked yesterday. . one in virginia. paid 8 . fixed up with 300k . asking 10

On Sun, Jan 15, 2017 at 10:27 AM, Alireza Ittihadich <} - o<

Why?
V-BR
Alireza ITTIHADIEH

From: jeffrey E.

Sent: Sunday, 15 January 2017 06:22
To: Alireza Ittihadieh

Subject: Re:

i stepped away from the royal jet. if you want to go after the bbj

On Sun, Jan 15, 2017 at 10:20 AM, Alireza Ittihadich ;> wrote:

| just got my G550 - 5176 under contract at $18.5 and it's going to Pre-Purchase inspection on Monday.
I'm aware that G550 - 5109 was under contract for $17,600,000.

As a company we have 5 G550, 2 G650 and 1 BBJ buyers.

That is all | know for now.

V-BR
Alireza ITTIHADIEH

From: jeffrey E.

Sent: Sunday, 15 January 2017 05:51
To: Alireza Ittihadieh

Subject: Re:

what about real trades? what number?

On Sun, Jan 15, 2017 at 9:49 AM, Alireza Ittihadich <G - ot

People are just back and the activity really started this week. A lot of enquiries out of China and a lot of
buyers in the US have resurfaced

V-BR
Alireza ITTIHADIEH

On 15 Jan 2017, at 04:17, jeftrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

what is trading , now that trump has won. ?
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